Wl Ref. Ares(2022)1770935 - 10/03/2022

From: (GROW)

To:

Cc: (GROW); (GROW);

Subject: RE: BusinessEurope: the 1st part of the follow up material: estimation of the cost of the notification process
Date: vendredi 22 octobre 2021 12:47:13

Dear ,

Thank you very much for the cost estimates. Yes we will take the opportunity to discuss the
estimates with her in German.

Looking forward to working with you

From:

Sent: Friday, October 22, 2021 8:44 AM
To: (GROW)

Cc: (GROW)

Subject: BusinessEurope: the 1st part of the follow up material: estimation of the cost of
the notification process
Importance: High

Dear ,
The time flies, and it is exactly a month from our meeting.

| have hoped to be able to send you the complete set of materials, but the information
from our member organisations keep on coming in.

Therefore, please, fiend enclosed a very concrete estimation of the cost of notification
from Mapal, a German company.

is ready to be contacted and discuss with in more detail, if needed.
Please, not that she is not so much at ease in English so she needs to prepare for a
discussion, unless you/your colleagues can exchange with her In German.

Below you will find contact details of

Phone:
Mobile:
Fax:

E-Mail:
http://www.mapal.com



https://urldefense.com/v3/__http:/www.mapal.com/__;!!DOxrgLBm!UoWmjC1I_6jIl8XwDn5AbqwG7VMDPMSDGJeP8KwPSPZRUXrq3GCdZLdELX67DJNupycqpQ9xpg$

MAPAL Fabrik fir Prazisionswerkzeuge Dr. Kress KG
Obere Bahnstr. 13

73431 Aalen

Germany

| will send the second part of materials around 6 November.

Kind regards,
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