B Ref. Ares(2013)1909677 - 10/06/2013

DE LUCA Patrizia (JUST)

From: Joan Ji Hyun Hansink <uai jhansink@gmail.com>
Sent: 24 November 2008 17:19

To: SAASTAMOINEN Salla (JLS)

Cc: DE LUCA Patrizia (JLS)

Subject: Re: Conference Adoption Procedures in Europe

Dear mrs De Luca and mrs Saastamoinen,
| have received your message in good order. | hereby confirm that | will participate at the

conference on behalf of United Adoptees International. | expect the travel agency to contact me
as soon as possible to arrange the booking of the hotel and flighticket to Strassbourg.

Yours sincerly,

Joan Hansink

2009/11/24 <SS

Dear Ms Hansink,

Thank you for your message of 28 October addressed to Vice-President Barrot concerning the Adoption
Conference organised by the European Commission and the Council of Europe on 31 November - 1 December
2008. | apologise the delay in replying. You write that you had not received a reply to your registration; |
understand that you have since, on 3 November, received a confirmation form the responsibie person and that
matter is solved.

As regards the travei and accommodation costs, | have the pleasure to inform you that the European
Commission, given the big success of the joint Conference on adoption, has made available an additional budget
to finance the participation of one representative of the NGOs and Academia from the Member States of the
European Union and of the Council of Europe which had registered to our Conference within the deadline.

| understand that you represent "United Adoptees international”. Therefore, | kindly ask you to confirm if your
organisation is interested in taking advantage of this possibility and, if this is the case, to communicate to Ms

Patrizia De Luca Qe e et SV 25 SOON 35 posSible,

the name of the person to be reimboursed.

in order to allow a swift reimboursement of her/his travel and accomodation fees, | kindly remind you to keep a
copy of your travel tickets and hotel invoices. The reimboursement will be done by the agency working with us in
the practical organisation of the conference. To this end, the responsible person will contact you in due time.

Yours,

Salla Saastamoinen



mailto:xxx.xxxxxxxx@xxxxx.xxx

DE LUCA Patrizia (JUST)

From: Roelie Post <roelie. post@gmail.com>
Sent: 24 November 2009 17:19

To: DE LUCA Patrizia (JLS)

Cc: SAASTAMOINEN Salia (JLS)
Subject: Re: Adoption Conference

| hereby confirm that |, Roelie Post, would like to participate. | await your travel Agency to contact
me to arrange the booking of travel/hotel asap.

Regards,

Roelie Post
www.agqainstchildtrafficking.org <http://www.againstchildtrafficking.ora/>

2009/11/24

Dear Ms Post,
Thank you for your message of 16 November, by which you ask to have your travel and accommodation costs

covered when you participate in the Adoption Conference organised by the European Commission and the
Council of Europe on 31 November - 1 December 2009. | apologise the delay in replying.

I understand that you represent organisation "Against Child Trafficking".

I have the pleasure to inform you that the European Commission, given the big success of the joint Conference
on adoption, has made available an additional budget to finance the participation of one representative of the
NGOs and Academia from the Member States of the European Union and of the Council of Europe which had
registered to our Conference within the deadiine.

Therefore, | kindly ask you to confirm that "Against Child Trafficking" is interested in taking advantage of this

possibility and, if this is the case, to communicate to Ms Patrizia De Luca s

as soon as possible, the name of the person to be
reimboursed.

In order to allow a swift reimboursement of her/his travel and accomodation fees, | kindly remind you to keep a
copy of your trave! tickets and hotel invoices. The reimboursement will be done by the agency working with us in
the practical organisation of the conference. To this end, the responsible person will contact you in due time.

Yours,

Salla Saastamoinen



mailto:xxxxxx.xxxx@xxxxx.xxx
http://www.aqainstchildtraffickinq.orq/

DE LUCA Patrizia (JUST)

From: DE LUCA Patrizia (JLS)

Sent: 23 November 2009 17:11

To: A RSN 'mymiemgetls ' s enE SRS
Subject: Possibility of reimboursement from one participant from your association

Importance: High

Dear Participants,

we have the pleasure to inform you that the European Commission, given the big success of the joint
conference on adoption, has made available an additional budget to finance the participation of one
representative of the NGOs from the Member States of the European Union and of the Council of Europe
which have registered to our conference within the deadline.

Therefore, I kindly ask you if the person already registered to the conference is still interested in taking
advantage of this possibility and, if this is the case, to confirm it to me as soon as possibile.

Concerning ENOC, already located in Strasbourg, may be you have another participant who would like to
come from outside?

In order to allow a swift reimboursement of your travel and accomodation fees, I kindly remind you to keep
a copy of your travel tickets and hotel invoices. The reimboursement will be done by the agency working
with us after the conference. To this end, the responsible person will contact you in due time.

Best regards,

Patrizia De Luca




